BID RESULTS
BID #
BID DATE/ TIME

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

NAME OF BIDDER

1

62018 Chemnical Supply Bid

1

1/28/2018 11:00am

GEORGE S. COYNE CHEMICAL CO.,
INC.

ORGANIZATION:

Main Pool and Chemical

Town of Newton

Holland Chemical Co. USALCO, LLC

Miracle Chemical Co

ADDRESS 3015 State Road 110 Commerce Road 153 Howland Ave 2601 Cannery Avenue 1151 B Hwy 33
CITY, STATE, ZIP Croydon, PA 19021 Dupont, Pa 18641 Adams, MA 01220 Baltimore, MD 21226 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
CONTACT Patti Leffler, Bid/Contract Melanie Orleski Melanie Rock Debbie Tyrrel~Executive Coordinator
Administrator
TELEPHONE 215-785-3000 X 7147 570-655-7211 Mike Holland T: 410-354-0100 9110 Ext 100
FAX
EMAIL pleffler@coynechemical.com mainpool@mainpoolchemical.com mike.holland@HollandCompany.com mrock@usalco.com Debbie@miraclechemical.com
INSURANCE REQUIRED FROM VENDOR - DATE RECEIVED
ADDENDA RECEIPT X X X X
BID GUARANTEE
CONSENT OF SURETY
BIDDERS ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA X X X X
OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE X X X
LIST OF SUBCONTRACTORS
IRAN CERT X X X X
PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION
PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION DATE
NON COLLUSION X X X X
EXHIBIT A/B ADVISORY ADVISORY ADVISORY ADVISORY ADVISORY
AA302 /CEIR X X X
AA201/ DATE
AA 2020/ DATE(S)
NEW JERSEY BRC X X X N
EXPERIENCE AND QUALIFICATIONS X X X X
DEBARRED FORM X X X X
PERFORMANCE BOND
LABOR AND MATERIAL BOND
WARRANTY BOND
ADA X X X X
Item 1: Liquid Sodium Carbonate 90,000 gallons at 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Gallon Price 0.7686000 0.6700000
Total $69.174.00 $60,300.00
Other: 5-7 busin aro reqd
Iltem 2 WWW 2400, 24,000 - 26,000 Gallons Yearly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Gallon Price $3.30
Total $79,200-$85,800
Other: 1-3 days
Item 3 Liquid Sulfur Dioxide 10,950 Pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Pound Price $1.42
Total $15,549.00
Other:
Item 4 Liquid Chlorine/Gas 10,950 pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Pound Price $0.88
Total $9.636.00
Other:
Item 6 Liquid Sodium Hydroxide 5,500 Gallons 25% NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.35650 1.88000
$12,960.75 $10,340.00
5-7 bus days aro
Item 7 Liquid Hydroflusilic Acid 1,250 Gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Gallon Price 4.10930 3.89000
Total $5.136.63 $4,862.50
Other:
Item 8 Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite 7,500 gallons NO BID NO BID
Per Gallon Price 2.249600 1.770000 2.190000
Total $16,872.00 $13,275.00 $16,425.00
Other:



mailto:mike.holland@HollandCompany.com

